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Where previous generations may have forsaken dinner conversation in
order to watch television together, the practical dimensions of a
laptop screen now preclude this act of "togetherness" (p342).
Nevertheless, any avenue that generally allows more opportunity for
contact between members of an immediate or extended family has to
be seen as advantageous. Moreover, the internet allows a sense of
inclusion that goes beyond the family sphere.

Moreover, this creates a sense of belonging to a religious or spiritual
community where one may have not existed before, as more and more
people commute, work longer hours and, indeed, are required to
work on public holidays, which often coincide with religious festivals
(Wong 2009).

Groups such as these use the internet to unite their followers globally
(Wong 2009). What is more, the internet is uniting people on a more
personal and intimate level. Expatriates can view electronic versions
of newspapers, stream and download news, current affairs
programmes and local dramas from their country of origin, so keeping
in contact with the culture.
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It could be argued, as Azhad (2008) does, that this process could be
facilitated just as easily by print media and DVD recordings being
sent through the mail, as would have been the norm a decade ago.
Equally, other facilities afforded by the internet, such as Skype,
enable someone away from home to still have a presence in the home
country as they participate in the celebration of cultural festivals and
national holidays, thus reinforcing their commitment to nationalism in
the eyes of their compatriots and tightening the ties that bind.

Alternatively, just as the internet serves to strengthen national
identity, it can also provide a point of reference for those who live in
a multicultural context. Finally, in a globalised world, the last ten
years have seen the internet augment a multicultural society by
creating a venue to air diverse cultural opinions and to construct
diverse cultural identities.

Mainstream newspapers, radio and current affairs programmes are
representative of a perceived norm and do not reflect the complexity
of ainsley harriott biography of william multicultural society. In turn,
ethnocentric or non-mainstream media reach a narrowly targeted
audience and serve to further ghettoize "the other" (Zadrow 2010 p.
The internet thus provides the opportunity for any voice to be heard
alongside and equally with all other voices in the country, community,
or indeed, the world.

In this way the internet equips ainsley harriott biography of william
global citizen with a fluidity they can use to exist and interact both
globally and locally, rather than being confined to a fixed and
marginalised identity. Notwithstanding the fact that the internet is
English based and broadly advocates a western lifestyle, this does not
necessarily mean it must lead to a homogenized world.

Citing the research of Kennard, Zadrow (2010) maintains that the
internet acts as an interactive archive from which an individual can
draw all the elements to both create and, more importantly, preserve



cultural identity.

It found the internet has had positive effects on family life, allowing
the hands on parenting of pre-school children by those parents who
are able to use the internet to work from home. In addition, it has
reinforced the extended family by harnessing email and social
networking sites as a means to ainsley harriott biography of
william in direct contact.

Furthermore, blogs, chat rooms ainsley harriott biography of william
video links have offered an alternative to attendance at religious
services, which have suffered such rapid decline in recent times.
Another positive effect of the internet is its ability to re-assert
national identity, particularly for those living abroad, as they retain
remote access to the home culture by being able to download or
stream current affairs or local drama.

Lismore, NSW, 28 to 31 July. Zadrow, K 2010, The well in the
mirror theories of subjectivity in the digital age, Elliott McGill Ltd,
viewed 28 July 2011, via Ovid eBooks.
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People tend to respond the same way when an historic building gets
torn down as when a stream or lake becomes polluted and no longer
fully available for recreation. Culture figures in the same way. People
tend to be welcoming but suspicious of outsiders who seek to impose
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change. Visitors may be welcomed by the ones and tens but not by the
thousands and tens of thousands. Over time, places tend to work out
their ethnic differences.

In time, immigrant neighborhoods, once maybe shunned, become
integrated with ainsley harriott biography of william mainstream
and valued for their integrity. These forces of conservation,
preservation and culture represent a significant bulwark against how
mainstream tourism tends to objectify places by narrow touristic
value.

But their effectiveness ainsley harriott biography of william
diluted when they operate independently of each other. Each has its
local partisans who tend to get involved with environmental causes,
with saving landmark structures from demolition, with conserving
historical artifacts and art.

At a time when homogenizing influences ascend with great power,
place represents a counterforce. And, as already indicated, place also
represents an important way of viewing travel. Therefore, place as a
concept joins what is local and long term in contrast to what is
outside and short term as invoked by leisure travel.

When locals address place instead ainsley harriott biography of
william only its separate aspects, the values of place strengthen. When
travelers become more aware of place rather than simply as
destination, they become more respectful of where they find
themselves. Indeed, travelers might easily be seen as people who
respect their own places while visiting places elsewhere, sensitized at
home by values they bring to the places they visit and that they share
with people resident there.

Locals everywhere, then, might well strengthen their capacity to slow
the impacts of change that mainstream tourism represents by
emphasizing their qualities of place.



Of course, for this to work, mainstream tourism will have to entertain
these qualities more willingly. One way to consider what might
happen is to look analogously at how organic foods and other natural
products increasingly show up on supermarket shelves.

Market forces are driving markets to expand what they have
historically either not supplied at all or in too small regard. The
question becomes, how to broaden the idea of travel by the concept of
place. Simultaneously, the separate elements of place need to come
together. Preservation viewed as elitist carries the same. Ditto culture
as Culture. Place carries no baggage. Granted that the term at least at
first appears awkward.
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